
Mr Barclay

CHRISTCHURCH TRAMWAY DISTRICT
AMENDMENT

Title

1. Short Title

[LOCAL]

ANALYSIS

2. Salary of Chairman
3. Members' fees

4. Unauthorised expenditure

A BILL INTITULED

An Act to amend the Christchurch Taamway District Act
1920

BE IT ENACTED by the General Assembly of New Zealand
5 in Parliament assembled, and by authority of the same, as

follows:

1. Short Titfe-This Act may be cited as the Christchurch
Tramway District Amendment Act 1970, and shall be read
together with and deemed part of the ChI'istchurch Tramway

10 District Act 1920 (hereinafter referred to as the principal
Act).

2. Salary of Chairman-Section 25 of the principal Act is
hereby amended by omitting the words "two hundred pounds",
and substituting the expression "$800".

No. 118-1

Price 55



2 Christchurch Tramway District Amendment

3. Members' fees-The principal Act is hereby amended
by repealing section 26, and substituting the following section:

"26. The Board may from time to time vote and pay to
each member of the Board, exclusive of the Chairman, a fee
or sum not exceeding $156 during any year of office, and for 5
this purpose each year shall be deemed to commence on the
last Tuesday in November:

"Provided that the amount payable to each member shall
be reduced by the sum of $3 in respect of each meeting of the
Board or a committee of the whole of the Board at which he 10

is not present at the time appointed for the holding of such
meeting or within 15 minutes thereafter:

"Provided further than not more than $3 shall be deducted
in respect of any member when 2 or more meetings are held
on the same day." 15

4. Unauthorised expenditure-Section 11 of the Christ-
church Tramway District Amendment Act 1921 is hereby
amended by omitting the words "two hundred and fifty
pounds", and substituting the expression "$1,000".

*LLINGTON, NEW ZEALAND: Printed under the authority of the New Zealand
Government, by A. R. SHEARER, Government Printer--1970


