
1202 

1984/248 

THE PRICE FREEZE REGULATIONS 1984, AMENDMENT NO. 2 

DA VID BEA TTIE, Governor-General 

ORDER IN COUNCIL 

At the Government Buildings at Wellington this 8th day 
of October 1984 

Present: 

THE RIGHT HON. DA VID LANGE PRESIDING IN COUNCIL 
PURSUANT to the Economic Stabilisation Act 1948, His Excellency the 
Governor-General, acting by and with the advice and consent of the 
Executive Council, hereby makes the following regulations_ 

I. Title 
2_ Commencement and expiry 
3. Expiry of principal rf'gulations 

ANALYSIS 

4. Notification of increases in prices 
5. Exemptions . 
6. Restrictions on ef(ective date of authorised 

price increases 

REGULATIONS 

1. Title-These regulations may be cited as the Price Freeze Regulations 
1984, Amendment No. 2, and shall be read together with and deemed part 
of the Price Freeze Regulations 1984" (hereinafter referred to as the principal 
regulations). 

'SR. 1984/193 
Amendment No. 1: S.R. 1984/202 



1984/248 Price Freeze Regulations 1984, 
Amendment No. 2 

1203 

2. COInlllencelllent and expiry-(I) These regulations shall come into 
force on the 9th day of October 1984. 

(2) These regulations shall continue in force until the close of the 8th 
day of November 1984, and shall then expire. 

3. Expiry of principal regulations-(I) Regulation 2 (2) of the principal 
regulations is hereby amended by omitting the words" 18th day of October 
1984", and substituting the words "8th day of November 1984". 

(2) Regulation 2 (2) of the Price Freeze Regulations 1984, Amendment 
No. 1 is hereby consequentially amended by omitting the words" 18th day 
of October 1984", and substituting the words "8th day of November 1984". 

4. Notification of increases in prices-Regulation 8 (2) of the principal 
regulations is hereby consequentially amended by omitting the words "18th 
day of October 1984", and substituting the words "8th day of November 
1984". 

5. Exelllptions-Regulation 17 of the principal regulations is hereby 
amended by inserting, after subclause (7), the following subclause: 

"(7 A) Nothing in these regulations (other than regulation 19) applies with 
respect to-

"(a) Any agreement to dispose of goods for valuable consideration after 
the 8th day of November 1984: 

"(b) Any offer to dispose of goods for valuable consideration after the 
8th day of November 1984: 

"(cl The publication or exhibition of a price list in respect of any goods 
or services, being goods to be sold or services to be supplied 
only after the 8th day of November 1984: 

"(d) The furnishing of a quotation for any goods or services, being goods 
to be sold or services to be supplied only after the 8th day of 
November 1984." 

6. Restrictions on effective date of authorised price increases­
Regulation 23 of the principal regulations is hereby consequentially amended 
by omitting from subclause (2), and also from subclause (3), the words "18th 
day of October 1984", and substituting in each case the words "8th day 
of November 1984". 

P. G. MILLEN, 
Clerk of the Executive Council. 



1204 Price Freeze Regulations 1984, 
Amendment No. 2 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

This note is not part of the regulations, but is intended to indicate their general effect. 

1984/248 

These regulations continue the Price Freeze Regulations 1984 in force until the close of 
8 November 1984. Those regulations were to have expired with the close of 18 October 1984. 

Regulation 5 provides that certain transactions and activities which take place during the 
period of the price freeze but which relate to the disposal of goods or the supply of services 
after 8 November 1984 will not contravene the principal regulations. 

Issued under the authority of the Regulations Act 1936. 
Date of notification in Gazette: 9 October 1984. 
These regulations are administered in the Department of Trade and Industry. 


