
135 

1985/38 

THE PESTICIDES (VERTEBRATE PEST CONTROL) 
REGULATIONS 1983, AMENDMENT NO. 1 

DA YID BEA TTlE, Governor-General 

ORDER IN COUNCIL 

At the Government Buildings at Wellington this 11th day 
of March 1985 

Present: 

THE HON. G. W. R. PALMER PRESIDING IN COUNCIL 

PURSUANT to section 53 of the Pesticides Act 1979, His Excellency the 
Governor-General, acting by and with the advice and consent of the 
Executive Council, hereby makes the following regulations. 

REGULATIONS 

1. Title and co.m.mence.ment-(l) These regulations may be cited as 
the Pesticides (Yertebrate Pest Control) Regulations 1983, Amendment No. 
1, and shall be read together with and deemed part of the Pesticides 
(Yertebrate Pest Control) Regulations 1983<> {hereinafter referred to as the 
principal regulations}_ 

(2) These regulations shall come into force on the 1st day of April 1985. 

2. Fees-(l) Regulation 11 (l) of the principal regulations is hereby 
amended by omitting the expression "$20", and substituting the 
expression "$40". 

(2) Regulation 11 {2} of the principal regulations is hereby amended by 
omitting the expression "$20", and substituting the expression "$40". 

{3} Regulation 11 of the principal regulations is hereby further amended 
by revoking subclauses {3} and (4). 

"S.R. 1983/16 



136 Pesticides (Vertebrate Pest Control) Regulations 1983, 
Amendment No. 1 

1985/38 

(4) Form 1 in the Schedule to the principal regulations is hereby amended 
by omitting the expression "$20", and substituting the expression "$40". 

P. G. MILLEN, 
Clerk of the Executive Council. 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

This note is not part of the regulatwns, but is intended to indicate theIT general effoct. 

These regulations-
(a) Increase from 520 to $40 the fee payable on an application for a licence to apply or 

otherwise use a controlled pesticide under Part V of the Pesticides Act 1979; and 
(b) Increase from 520 to 540 the fee payable on an application for a variation of the terms 

or conditions of any such licence; and 
(cl Remove the present exemption from such fees enjoyed by land owners using 

phosphorised paste supplied by Pest Destruction Boards, and employees of 
Government departments and public bodies where such a licence is required in 
connection with their official duties. 

Issued under the authority of the Regulations Act 1936. 
Date of notification in Gautt" 14 March 1985. 
These regulations are administered in the Ministry of Agriculture and Fisheries. 


