
259 

1977/41 

THE QUANTITY SURVEYORS REGULATIONS 1969, 
AMENDMENT NO. 2 

DENIS BLUNDELL, Governor-General 

ORDER IN COUNCIL 

At the Government Buildings at Wellington this 14th day of March 1977 

Present: 
THE RIGHT HON. R. D. MULDOON PRESIDING IN COUNCIL 

PURSUANT to the Quantity Surveyors Act 1968, His Excellency the 
Governor-General, acting by and with the advice and consent of the 
Executive Council, hereby makes the following regulations. 

REGULATIONS 

1. Title and commencement-( 1) These regulations may be cited as 
the Quantity Surveyors Regulations 1969, Amendment No. 2, and shall 
be read together with and deemed part of the Quantity Surveyors 
Regulations 1969* (hereinafter referred to as the principal regulations). 

(2) These regulations shall come into force on the day after the date 
of their notification in the Gazette. 

2. Fees-( 1) Regulation 17 of the principal regulations is hereby 
amended-

(a) By omitting from subclause (1) the expression "$25.00", and sub
stituting the expression "$40.00": 

(b) By omitting from subclause (2) the expression "$5.00", and sub
stituting the expression "$10.00": 

(c) By omitting from subclause (5) the expression "$10.00", and sub
stituting the expression "$15.00". 

(2) Regulation 40 of the principal regulations (as inserted by 
regulation 2 of the Quantity Surveyors Regulations 1969, Amend
ment No. 1) is hereby amended by revoking sub clause (2), and 
substituting the following subclause: 

"(2) The fee for the written examination shall be $10.00 per 
paper." 

*S.R. 1969/182 
Amendment No. 1: S.R. 1970/51 

Call. Regs.-9" 



260 Quantity Surveyors Regulations 1969, 
Amendment No. 2 

1977/41 

3. Forms-The Schedule to the principal regulations is hereby 
amended-

(a) In Form 3, by omitting the expression "$25.00", and substituting 
the expression "$40.00": 

(b) In Form 3, by omitting from paragraph (2) the word "technical" 
(in the second place where it appears), and substituting the 
word "my": 

( c) In Form 4, by omitting the expression "$10.00", and substituting 
the expression "$15.00": 

(d) In Form 8 (as inserted by regulation 3 of the Quantity Surveyors 
Regulations 1969, Amendment No. 1), by omitting from 
paragraph 6 the expression "$15.00", and substituting the 
expression "$ ............ ". 

P. G. MILLEN, 
Clerk of the Executive Council. 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 
This Rote is not part 0/ the regulations, but is intended to indicate their general 

effect. 
These regulations increase the fees for applications for registration, registration, 

and annual practising certificates, and alter the fees payable for written ex
aminations. Minor changes are also made to the fonns in the Schedule. 

Issued under the authority of the Regulations Act 1936. 
Date of notification in Gazette: 17 March 1977. 
These regulations are administered in the Ministry of Works and Development. 


