
NORTH ISLAND DAIRY-FACTORY MANAGERS.-AMENDMENT 
OF AWARD 

rn· the Court of Arbitration of New Zealand, Northern, Taranaki, and 
Wellington Industrial Districts.- In the matter of the Industrial 
Conciliation and Arbitration Act, 1925, and its amendments ; 
and in the matter of the North Island Dairy-factory Managers' 
award, dated t he 27th day of July, J 945, and recorded in 45 Book 
of Awards 937. 



736' 

UPON reading the joint application for amendment of the orth 
I sland Dairy-factory Managers' award, dated the 27th day of July, 
1945, and recorded in 45 Book of A wards 937, this Court, in pursuance 
and exercise of the powers vested in it by section 92 (1) (c') of the 
Industrial Conciliation and Arbitration Act, 1925, and of everv other 
power in that behalf thereunto enabling it, and with the cori'sent of 
the p;::i,rties, doth hereby order a follow :-

1. That the said award shall be amended in the manner fo ll6wi1{g :
(i) By deleting the figures " £325 " iu subclause (a) of clause 1 , 

and substituting therefor the figures " £377 ." 
(ii) By deleting the figures " £305" in subclause (b) of clause 1, 

and substituting therefor the .:figures " £357. " 
(iii) By deleting the figures " £375 " and the figures " £475" in 

subclause (c) of clause 1, and substituting therefor the figures " £427 ,,. 
and the figure " £527 " respectively. 

(iv) By deleting subclause (d) of clause 1, and substituting therefor 
the following . ubclause :-

" Dual-JJlant 1 actories and Cheese-factories niaking Their Own Whey
butter.- The tqnnao-e shall be computed on the total tonnage of cheese 
and butter added together,· and the cheese schedule shall be the ba i 
on which th combined total is calculated for payment." 

(v) By deleting clause 8 (Accident Insurance). 
(vi) By deleting clause J2, and substituting therefor the following 

clause:-
'' General 

" 12. Managers subj ect to this award shall be entitled to one day 
off in each week to be taken at a time to suit the work of the factory. 

• If a manager is called upon to work on more than six days in any week 
he shall be paid at the rate of 7s. 6d. per hour for all time worked on 
the seventh day, with a maximum payment of £3 for any day: Provided 
always that the manager shall comply with such rules as his employer 
shall lay down in respect of determining the need to work and 
verification of the time worked. 

" Where a manager is required to pull presses after the ordinary 
factory work is finished, he shall be paid 3d. per press per day." 

(vii) By deleting the words and figures " 31st day of May, 1947," 
in clause 16, and substituting therefor the words and figures " 31st day 
of May, 1948." 

2. That this order, except subclauses (i), (ii), (iii), and (iv) of 
clause 1, shall come into force on the day of the date hereof. Sub
clauses (i), (ii) , (iii) , and (iv) of clause 1 shall be. deemed to have come 
into force on the 1st day of August, 1946. 

Dated this 30th day of May, 1947. 
[L.s .] A. TYNDALL, Judge. 


