
1471 

NEW ZEALAND TIMBER INDUSTRY-AMENDMENT OF APPRENTICESHIP 
ORDER 

In the Court of Arbitration of New Zealand-In the matter of the Apprentices 
Act 1948; and in the matter of the New Zealand Timber Industry Apprenticeship 
Order, dated the 26th day of July 1956, and recorded in 56 Book of Awards 1146. 

WHEREAS by section 13 (2) of the Apprentices Act 1948, the Court is empowerecl 
to amend any apprenticeship order: And whereas application has been made to the 
Court by the New Zealand Timber Industry Apprenticeship Committee for amend
ment of the New Zealand Timber Industry Apprenticeship Order, dated the 26th 
day of July 1956, and recorded in 56 Book of Awards 1146: And whereas the 
Court has considered the recommendations made to it by the said Committee: 
Now therefore, the Court, 1in pursuance and exercise of the powers vested in it by 
the said Act, doth hereby orde\f as follows: 

1. That the said apprenticeship order shall be amentled by deleting clause 10 
and substituting the following clause: 

"10. Wages-The minimum weekly rates of wages payable to apprentices in 
machining shall be the undermentioned percentages of an amount equal to 40 
times the minimum hourly rate for a millwright and to apprentices in saw-doctoring 
the same percentages of an amount equal to 40 times the minimum hourly rate for 
a saw doctor, as prescribed by the New Zealand (except Marlborough, Nelson, 
and Westland) Timber Workers' award in force for the time being and from 
time to time: 

Percent 
First 1,000-hour period 50 
Second 1,000-hour period 55 
Third 1,000-hour period 60 
Fourth 1,000-hour period ... ... 65 
Fi.Eth 1,000-hour period 75 
Sixth 1,000-hour period 85" 

2. That this order shall operate and take effect from the day of the elate hereof. 
Dated this 26th day of September 1966. 

A P. BLAm, Judge. 

NORTHLAND, THAMES, TAURANGA, BAY OF PLENTY, OPOTIKI, TAUMARUNUI, 
AND WAJAPU HOSPITAL BOARDS' CLERICAL AND OTHER WORKERS'
VARIATION OF INDUSTRIAL AGREEMENT 

Tms Industrial Agreement made in pursuance of the Industrial Conciliation 
and Arbitration Act, 1954 this 31st day of August 1966. 

Between The Northland, Thames, Tauranga, Bay of Plenty, Opotiki, Tau
marunui, Waiapu Hospital Boards and the Auckland Provincial District 
Local Authorities' Officers Industrial Union of Workers. 

Whereby it is mutually agreed by and between the said parties that the 
Industrial Agreement made between the parties on the 1st day of July 1965 
as amended on the 18th day of October 1965, and on the 6th day of May 
1966 shall be and is hereby further varied in the manner following. 

(i) That Clause 1 (b) be amended by deleting the figure '£1640' and in
serting the figure '£1690'. 

That Clause 1 (c) be amended by deleting the figure '£1740' and inserting 
the figure '£1790'. 




