
640 

(i) That Clause 1 (b) be amended by deleting the figure '£1,620' and inserting 
the figure '£1,640.' 

Clause 1 ( c) be amended by deleting the figure '£1,720' and inserting the 
figure '£1,740.' 

Clause 1 (d) be amended by deleting the figure '£1,250' and inserting the 
figure '£1,265.' 

(ii) That Clauses 3 (a) (b) and (c) and (d) be amended by deleting the 
salaries specified against the respective years of service therein and substituting 
as under: 

Clause 3 (a) 
11th year delete £1,023 substitute £1 ,025 
12th year delete £1,059 substitute £1,064 
13th year delete £1,084 substitute £1,089 
14th year delete £1,100 substitute £1,105 
Grade 2 Male Officers. 

Delete '£1,720' and '£1 ,620' and insert '£1,740' and '£1,640' respectively. 
Clause 3 (b) 

Delete '£1,023' and insert '£1,025.' 
Clause 3 (b) (ii) 

Delete '£1,059' and insert '£1,064.' 
Clause 3 ( c) Grade 2 Female Officers 

Delete '£1,250' and insert '£1,265.' 
(iii) That Clause 6 (b) be amended by deleting the figure '£1,545' and inserting 

the figure '£1,565.' 
The amendments provided for in the above clauses shall be deemed to come 

into force on the 26th day of August, 1964. 
Signed on behalf of the Northland, Thames, Tauranga, Bay of Plenty, Opotiki, 

Taumarunui, and Waiapu Hospital Boards. 
A. G. WILSON, Assessor. 
A. J. REGAN, Assessor. 

Signed on behalf of the Auckland Provincial District Local Authorities Officers 
Industrial Union of Workers . 

J. B. DAVY, Secretary. 

NEW ZEALAND AIRWAYS CLERICAL EMPLOYEES-ORDER STRIKING OUT 
PARTY 

In the Court of Arbitration of New Zealand, Canterbury Industrial District
In the matter of the Industrial Conciliation and Arbitration Act 1954; and in the 
matter of the New Zealand Airways Clerical Employees Award, dated the 14th 
day of December 1965, and recorded in 65 Book of Awards .. . 

FRIDAY, THE 24TH DAY OF JUNE 1966 
In pursuance and exercise of the powers conferred upon it by section 162 (1) (a) 

of the Industrial Conciliation and Arbitration Act 1954 and after hearing the duly 
appointed representatives of the parties concerned, the Court doth hereby order that 
the New Zealand Airways Clerical Employees Award, dated the 14th day of December 
1965, shall be amended by striking out from the list of parties thereto the name of 
Airwork N .Z. Ltd, Christchurch International Airport. 

[L.s.] A. P. BLAIR, Judge. 


