
2015 

amendment of the New Zealand Footwear Manufacturing Industry Apprenticeship 
Order dated the 12th day of September 1962, and recorded in 62 Book of Awards 
1557: and Whereas the Court has considered the recommendations made to it by 
the said Committee: Now therefore, the Court, in pursuance and exercise of the 
powers vested in it by the said Act, doth hereby order as follows: 

1. That the said apprenticeship order shall be amended in the manner following: 
(1) By deleting subclause (a) of clause 7 (Term of Apprenticeship) and sub

stituting therefor the following subclause: 
"(a) The term of apprenticeship shall be 8,000 hours divided into eight 1,000-

hour periods." 
(2) By deleting subclause (b) of clause 7 (Term of Apprenticeship). 
(3) By deleting clause 10 and substituting therefor the following clause: 
"10. Wages-The minimum weekly rates of wages payable to apprentices shall 

be the undermentioned percentages of an amount equal to 40 times the minimum 
hourly rate of wages for adult male workers engaged in the operations and skills in 
respect of which the apprentice is apprenticed as prescribed in the award or agree
ment relating to the employment of such workers for the time being and from time 
to time in force in the establishment in which the apprentice is employed, or, if there 
is no such award or agreement, as prescribed by the award or agreement relating to 
the employment of such adult male workers for the time being and from time to time 
in force in a locality including the city of Wellington. 

Percent 
First 1,000-hour period 42 
Second 1,000-hour period 47 
Third 1,000-hour period 52 
Fourth 1,000-hour period 57 
Fifth 1,000-hour period 62 
Sixth 1,000-hour period 67 
Seventh 1,000-hour period 72 
Eighth 1,000-hour period 77" 

2. That this order shall operate and take effect as from the day of the date hereof. 
Dated this 1st day of November 1967. 

[L.S.] A. P. BLAIR, Judge. 

NORTHLAND, TIIAMES, TA URANGA, BAY OF PLENTY, OPOTIKI, TAUMARUNUI, 
WAIAPU HOSPITAL BOARDS' CLERICAL AND OTHER WORKERS'- VARIATION 
OF INDUSTRIAL AGREEMENT 

Tms ind us trial agreement made in pursuance of the Ind us trial Conciliation and 
Arbitration Act, 1954 this 20th day of October 1967 between the Northland, 
Thames, Tauranga, Bay of Plenty, Opotiki, Taumarunui, Waiapu Hospital Boards 
and the Auckland Provincial District Local Authorities' Officers Industrial Union 
of Workers, whereby it is mutually agreed by and between the said parties that 
the industrial agreement made between the parties on the 1st day of September 
1966 shall be and is hereby varied in the manner following: 

(i) That clause 1 (b) be amended by deleting the figures "£1,700 p.a. ($3,400)" 
and inserting the figure "$3,540". 

That clause 1 (c) be amended by deleting the figures "£1,835 p.a. ($3,670)" 
and inserting the figure "$3,810". 



2016 

Oause 1 (d) be amended by deleting the figures "£1,360 p.a. ($2,720)" and 
inserting the figure "$2,860". 

(ii) That clauses 3 (a) (b) and (c) and (d) be amended by deleting the salaries 
specified against the respective years of service therein and substituting as under: 

3 (a) Administrative: 
Grade I 

First year 
Second year 
Third year 
Fourth year 
Fifth year 
Sixth year 
Seventh year 
Eighth year 
Ninth year 
Tenth year 
Eleventh year 
Twelfth year 
Thirteenth year 

Grade 2 Male Officers 

Rate per annum 
$ 

940 
1,094 
1,250 
1,414 
1,572 
1,742 
1,876 
2,056 
2,142 
2,204 
2,294 
2,378 
2,460 

Delete "£1,835 ($3,670" and "£1,700 ($3,400)" and insert "$3,810" and 
"$3,540" respectively. 
Clause 3 ( b) (i) 

Delete "£1,085 ($2,170)" and insert "$2,294". 
Clause 3 ( b) (ii) 

Delete "£1,124 ($2,248)" and insert "$2,378". 
Clause 3 (c) Female Officers 

Grade I 
First year 
Second year 
Third year 
Fourth year 
Fifth year 
Sixth year 
Seventh year 
Eighth year 

Clause 3 (c) Female Officers Grade 2 
Delete "£1,360 ($2,720)" and insert "$2,860". 

Clause 3 (d) 
Delete "£883 ($1,766)" and insert "$1,876". 

Rate per annum 
$ 

940 
1,094 
1,250 
1,414 
1,572 
1,742 
1,876 
1,966 

(iii) That clause 6 (b) be amended by deleting the figure "£1,625 ($3,250)" 
and inserting the figure "$3,390". 

The amendments provided for in the above clauses shall be deemed to come 
into force on the 14th day of September 1966. 

Signed on behalf of the Northland, Thames, Tauranga, Bay of Plenty, Opotiki, 
Taumarunui and Waiapu Hospital Boards: 

A. G. WILSON, Assessor. 
A. J. REGAN, Assessor. 

Signed on behalf of the Auckland Provincial District Local Authorities' Officers 
Industrial Union of Workers: 

J. B. DAVY, Secretary. 


