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6. Miscellaneous-continued 

The following rates will be amended as indicated :-

From 

Stations Parore to 
Donnelly's 
Crossing, inclusive 

Auckland, New.~ 
market or 
Mount Eden 

L 

Auckland orf 
Mount Eden i 

L 
Auckland, Mount 

Eden, One. 
hunga, Otahuhu 
and inter· 
mediate stations 

Auckland or Mount 
Eden 

Auckland, Mount 
Eden, One. 
hung .. , Ota· 
huhu, and inter. 
mediate stations 

Auckland 

Auckland 

( 

Westfield andj 
Southdown I 

Westfield 

1 
Southdown 

Tauranga 
Stations Kairua­

Pongakawa inolu. 
sive 

l'almerston N 6rth 

FtlXtdil 

W6Jllpgtdn 

Wellington 

Wellington 

To Description of Goods. 

Auckland, Mount (Class C 
Eden, Onehunga, I Class D 
Otahuhu, and ~ Returned empty 44.gallon 
intermediate I drums 
stations L 

Whangarei Classes C and D n.o.s. except 

Hikurangi 

Wellington 
Messrs. N.Z. Wall· 

boards Ltd. 's 
private siding 
near Woburn 

Stations Parore to 
Donnelly's 
Crossing, inclu· 
sive 

Tatuanui or Waitoa 

Thames, Thames 
North, or Paeroa 

1 
Wellington 

Napier 

Auckland, New. 
market, and 
Mount Eden 

Onehunga 

Auckland Farmers' 
Freezing Co.'s 
Siding, South· 
down 

Southdown 

explosives 
Classes C and D n.o.s. except 

explosives 
Plaster, direct ex factory 
Plaster, direct ex factory 

(Class C, n.o.s. 
I Class D, n.o.s. 
~ Benzine, kerosene, and fuel 
I oil in 44.gallon drums 
L 
Empty tins and lids for the 

packing of milk-powder 
Classes C and D, n.o.s. 

Honey, in bulk, packed, 
direct from blending store 

Honey, in cartons, packed, 
direct from blending store 

Honey, in bulk, packed, 
direct from blending store 

Honey, in cartons, packed, 
direct from blending store 

Oil, soap, candles, soda 
crystals, starch, refined 
tallow, sulphurio acid, and 
oil· cake, and their by­
products; and empties 

Oil, soap, candles, soda 
crystals, staroh, sulphuric 
acid, and oil-cake, and their 
by.products; and empties 

Frozen meat 

Live·stock 

r Live·stock 
Westfield 

Auckland 
Auokland 

Wellington 

Wellington 

Wellington 

Wanganui 

Terrace End 

Palmerston N. 

1 Boneless beef for canning 
purposes 

Honey, extracted, packed .. 
Hemp and tow in bales 

r Classes C, D, E, and E plus 
50 per cent., and empty 

I returns (excepting ben· 

IL 
zine in bulk, explosives, 
dairy-produce, and meat, 
frozen or chilled). Owner's 
risk 

Classes C, D, E, and E plus 
50 per cent., and empty 
returns (explosives 
excepted). Owner'srisk 

Hemp and tow, in bales, 
dressed, pressed 

Classes C, D. E. and E plus 
50 per cent., and empty. 
returns (exoepting ben. 
zine in bulk, explosives, 

.and motor-cars in cases). 
Owner's risk 

Oil, Diesel, crude and fuel, in 
. owners' tank wagons 

Classes C, D, E, and E plus 
50 per cent., and empty 
returns .(explosives 
except,ed), Owner's risk 

Hate. 

Omit. 
s. d. 

63 0 
57 0 
2 5 

62 6 

65 6 

56 5 
56 7 

63 0 
57 0 
1010 

39 6 

37 6 

*56 6 

70 8 

*63 0 

78 9 

6 6 
13 0 

6 6 
13 0 

1 11 
18 0 

J18 0 
1.24 0 

{ 18 0 
24 0 

1 11 
18 0 
52 2 
38 5 

38 0 

20 1 
26 5 

1 4 

27 4 

41 0 

46 10 

20 1 

Insert. 
s. d. 

71 0 
64 2 
3 3 

69 9 

73 8 

65 10 
66 0 

71 0 
64 2 
12 2 

52 8 

47 0 

*63 6 

79 0 

*70 0 

87 0 

7 4 
14 8 

7 4 
14 8 

2 6 
24 0 

24 0 
32 0 
24 0 
32 0 
2 6 

24 0 
70 0 
51 3 

45 6 

27 0 
:15 0 

1 6 

36 5 

48 6 

48 10 

27 0 

1725 


