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TASMAN 
ALL that piece comprising the Boroughs of Motueka and Richmond; 
the Counties of Golden Bay and Waimea; the Croisilles French Pass 
Riding and that part of the Pelorus Riding of the County of 
Marlborough, as defined by New Zealand Gazette, 1976, p. 644, 
bounded by a line commencing at Black Point in Block V, Linkwater 
Survey District, and proceeding generally south-westerly up the 
Pelorus Sound to Cullens Point in Block VIII, Wakamarina Survey 
District; thence generally south-easterly along the eastern watershed 
of the Kaituna River to Trig Station MM, Mt. Cullen, in Block XIII, 
Linkwater Survey District; thence generally westerly along a right 
line to the source of Rocky Creek, and down the middle of that 
creek, Kaituna River, and up the middle of Atahaua Stream to its 
source; thence along a right line to Trig Station, Mt. Sunday in Block 
VI, Onamalutu Survey District, being a point on the boundary of the 
Pelorus Riding: thence generally south-westerly, northerly, and 
easterly along that boundary to the point of commencement. 

NELSON 

ALL that piece comprising the City of Nelson. 

MARLBOROUGH 

ALL that piece comprising the Boroughs of Blenheim and Picton, the 
County of Kaikoura, and that portion of the County of Marlborough, 
as defined in New Zealand Gazette, 1976, p. 644, which is not 
included in the Electoral District of Tasman hereinbefore described. 

RANGIORA 

ALL that piece comprising the Boroughs of Rangiora and Kaiapoi, 
the Counties of Amuri, Cheviot, Waipara, Ashley, Oxford, 
Rangiora, Eyre, and that portion of the Styx Riding of the County of 
Waimairi bounded by a line commencing at the intersection of the 
middle lines of Prestons Road and Burwood Road and proceeding 
north-westerly along a right line to the middle of Dunlops Road; 
thence along the middle of Dunlops Road, Lower Styx Road, and 
Marshlands Road to the middle of the Styx River; thence generally 
south-westerly up the middle of that river to the boundary of Styx 
Riding; thence generally north-westerly, north-easterly, southerly, 
and westerly along that boundary to the middle of Mairehau Road; 
thence generally north-westerly and northerly along the middle of 
that road and Burwood Road to the point of commencement. 

PAPANUI 

ALL that piece comprising those portions of the City of Christchurch, 
and the Counties of Waimairi and Paparua, bounded by a line 
commencing at the intersection of the middle lines of Harewood 
Road and McArthurs Road and proceeding northerly along the 
middle of McArthurs Road and its production to the boundary of the 
Electoral District of Rangiora hereinbefore described; thence 
generally north-easterly and south-easterly along that boundary to 
the boundary of the Marshlands Riding of the County of Waimairi; 
thence generally westerly and southerly along that boundary to 
Rutland Street; thence generally southerly and westerly along the 
middle of Rutland Street, Mays Road, Papanui Road, and Blighs 
Road to the middle of Wairakei Road; thence south-easterly along 
the middle of Wairakei Road to the boundary of the City of 
Christchurch; thence generally south-westerly and north-westerly 
along that boundary to the middle of Wairakei Road; thence north­
westerly along the middle of that road to a point in line with the 
eastern boundary of Part Reserve 947, thence northerly to and along 
that boundary and its extension to the middle of Harewood Road; 
thence westerly along the middle of that road to the point of 
commencement. 

ST. ALBANS 

ALL that piece comprising those portions of the City of Christchurch, 
and the County of Waimairi, bounded by a line commencing at the 
intersection of the middle of Clare and Papanui Roads, and 
proceeding north-westerly along the middle of Papanui Road to the 
boundary of the Electoral District of Papanui, hereinbefore 
described; thence generally northerly, easterly, and southerly along 
that boundary and the boundary of the Electoral District of 
Rangiora, hereinbefore described, to the intersection of Burwood 
Road and Mairehau Road; thence southerly along the middle of 
Burwood Road and Lake Terrace Road and its production to the 
middle of the Avon River; thence generally southerly up the middle 
of that river (through Kerrs Reach) and Dudley Creek to the middle 
of Averill Street; thence generally southerly and easterly to and along 
the middle of Stapletons Road, Stanmore Road, Avalon Street, 
Perth Street, London Street, Bealey Avenue, Geraldine Street, 
Purchas Street, Caledonian Road, Durham Street, Springfield Road, 
and Clare Road to the point of commencement. 

FENDALTON 

ALL that piece comprising those portions of the City of Christchurch, 
the Borough of Riccarton, and the County of Waimairi bounded by a 
line commencing at the intersection of the middle lines of Hansons 
Lane and Riccarton Road and proceeding generally northerly along 
the middle of Riccarton Road, Waimairi Road, and Wadeley Road to 
a point in line with the northern boundary of Lot 13, D.P. 22700; 
thence north-easterly to and along that boundary and the northern 
boundaries of Lots 6, 5, 4, 3, 2, and 1, D.P. 23640 and the production 
of the last-mentioned lot to the middle of Ilam Road; thence 
generally northerly along the middle of Ilam Road, Memorial 
Avenue, and Grahams Road to the boundary of the Electoral District 
of Papanui, hereinbefore described; thence generally south-easterly 
and southerly along that boundary, the boundary of the Electoral 
District of Christchurch Central, hereinbefore described and its 
production to the middle of the Lyttelton Bluff Railway; thence 
westerly along the middle of that railway to a point in line with the 
middle of Twigger Street; thence south-easterly to and along the 
middle of that road and along the boundary of the City of 
Christchurch to Lincoln Road; thence south-westerly along the 
middle of that road to the boundary of the City of Christchurch; 
thence northerly along the boundary and the boundary of the County 
of Waimairi to the point of commencement. 

CHRISTCHURCH CENTRAL 

ALL that piece comprising that portion of the City of Christchurch 
bounded by a line commencing at the intersection of the middle lines 
of Moorhouse Avenue and Deans Avenue, and proceeding northerly 
along the middle of Deans Avenue and its production to the middle 
of the Avon River; thence generally north-easterly down the middle 
of that river and the middle of Bealey Avenue, and Papanui Road to 
the boundary of the Electoral District of St. Albans hereinbefore 
described; thence generally easterly along that boundary to a point in 
line with the middle of Kerrs Road; thence generally southerly to and 
along the middle of Kerrs Road, Buckleys Road, Butterfield 
Avenue, McGregors Road, and Keighleys Road to a point in line 
with the production of the western boundary of Lot 1, D.P. 8825, 
thence southerly to and along that boundary and its production to the 
middle of Linwood Avenue; thence south-easterly and south­
westerly along the middle of that street and St. Johns Street to the 
middle of Ferry Road; thence north-westerly along the middle of that 
street and Ensors Road to the middle of the Lyttelton Bluff Railway; 
thence north-westerly along that railway line to the middle of 
Waltham Road; thence northerly along the middle of that street and 
westerly along Moorhouse Avenue to the point of commencement. 

AVON 
ALL that piece comprising those portions of the City of Christchurch 
and County of Waimairi bounded by a line commencing at Cave 
Rock near Sumner and proceeding generally north-westerly along the 
MHWM of the sea and the southern shore of the Estuary of the Avon 
and Heathcote Rivers to a point in line with the middle of Linwood 
Avenue; thence north-westerly to and along the middle of Linwood 
Avenue to the boundary of the Electorate of Christchurch Central as 
hereinbefore described; thence generally northerly and easterly along 
that boundary, the boundaries of the Electoral Districts of St. Albans 
and Rangiora as hereinbefore described to the boundary of the City 
of Christchurch; thence generally easterly and south-easterly along 
that boundary to the point of commencement. 

YALDHURST 

ALL that piece comprising those portions of the Counties of Paparua 
and Waimairi bounded by a line commencing at t!JS! intersection of 
the middle of Riccarton Road and Hansons Lane and proceeding 
generally south-westerly along the middle of Riccarton Road, Main 
South Road, and Springs Road, north-westerly along the south­
western boundary of Homby Riding to the middle of Shands Road; 
thence generally westerly along the middle of Shands Road, Halswell 
Junction Road, Main South Road to a point in line with the middle of 
Pound Road; thence generally north-easterly to and along the middle 
of that road to the boundary of the Electoral District of Papanui 
hereinbefore described; thence generally south-easterly along that 
boundary and the boundary of the Electoral District of Fendalton to 
the point of commencement. 

SYDENHAM 

ALL that piece comprising those portions of the City of Christchurch, 
the Borough of Riccarton and the County of Paparua bounded by a 
line commencing at the intersection of the middle lines of the 
Lyttelton Bluff Railway and Ensors Road; and proceeding south­
westerly along the middle of Ensors Road and its production to the 
middle of the Heathcote River; thence south-westerly up the middle 
of that river to its confluence with the Cashmere Stream, being a 
point on the boundary of the City of Christchurch; thence generally 
north-westerly along that boundary to the middle of Sparks Road; 
thence south-westerly along the middle of Sparks Road, and north­
westerly along the middle of Hendersons Road to the boundary of 


