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Post Office Bonus Bonds-Weekly Prize Draw No.3, January 
1986 

PURSUANT to the Post Office Act 1959, notice is hereby given that 
the result ofthe weekly Prize Draw NO.3 for 18 January is as follows: 

One prize of $25,000: 9086250930. 
Thirteen prizes of $5,000: 034684181, 

1887 170622, 
2693795302, 
3394623751, 
3691 616088, 
4587 448930, 
6086801358, 
6581 067032, 
6584398621, 
6881 156488, 
7981 203841, 
8384 508008, 
8986815582. 

JONATHAN HUNT, Postmaster-General. 

Customs Act-Dumping Duty 

PURSUANT to the provisions of section 186A (3) of the Customs 
Act 1966, notice is hereby given that dumping duty, equivalent to 
100 percent of the amount by which the Export Selling price is less 
than the Normal value, determined in accordance with the 
provisions of this Act, shall be payable in respect of the following 
goods exported from Australia by Carlton & United Breweries of 
Australia, imported on and after 7 August 1985. 

Tariff Item 
22.03 Beer from malt 
22.03.04I.00H Containing more than 4.35 percent but not more 

than 5 percent alcohol volume. 
Dated at Wellington this 16th day of January 1986. 

MARGARET SHIELDS, Minister of Customs. 

Kaweka Recreational Hunting Area 

PURfUANT to section 27 of the Wild Animal Control Act 1977, the 
Dire tor-General of Forests hereby gives notice that an area ofland 
cont ining approximately 30 850 hectares, being those areas of 
Kaweka State Forest Park described in the First and Second 
Schedules hereto shall form a recreational hunting area, to be known 
as the Kaweka Recreational Hunting Area. 

FIRST SCHEDULE 

HAWKE'S BAY LAND DISTRICT-WELLINGTON CONSERVANCY-
HAWKE'S BAY COUNTY 

ALL that area in the Hawke's Bay Land District, Hawke's Bay 
County, containing 23640 hectares, more or less, commencing on 
the northern boundary of Kaweka State Forest Park at the southern­
most comer of Tapapa No.3 Block in Block XII, Kaweka Survey 
District, thence by a right line in a southerly direction to Vension 
Top situated on the boundary of Blocks XIX and XX, Kaweka 
Survey District, thence generally easterly along a ridge top forming 
the watershed boundary between the Makino River and Rocks 
Ahead Stream to the junction of that ridge top and the Kaweka 
Range and being the north-western comer of Pastoral Run 13 in 
Block XX, Kaweka Survey District, thence generally southerly along 
the top of the Kaweka Range passing Trigonometrical Station 
Kaweka J to Kaiarahi Trigonometrical Station in Block II, 
Kuripapango Survey District, thence generally westerly and south­
westerly along a ridge top forming the watershed boundary between 
Kiwi Creek and Tutaekuri River to a point on that ridge top at a 
ridge junction (marked A) in Block IV, Kuripapango Survey District, 
thence generally westerly along the ridge top and track forming the 
watershed boundary between Kiwi Creek and unnamed creeks to 
the south flowing to the Ngaruroro River (marked B), thence 
southerly along a spur and track dropping into the Ngaruroro River 
at the position of Cameron Hut on the southern boundary of Pastoral 
Run 14 in Block IV, Kuripapango Survey District, thence generally 
south-easterly along the true left bank of the Ngaruroro River being 
the southern boundary of Pastoral Run 14 and the western boundary 
part Block 135, Patoka Crown Grant District in Block IX, 
Kuripapango Survey District to the confluence of the Waikarakara 
Stream, thence generally north-easterly up Waikarakara Stream 
forming the southern boundary of Block 135, Patoka Crown Grant 
District and continuing up the Waikarakara Steam to a point on 
that stream (marked C) in Block 134, Patoka Crown Grant District 

in Block IX, Kuripapango Survey District, thence continuing 
generally north-easterly for a distance of approximately 2.2 
kilometres to a point (marked D) in Block 134, Patoka Crown Grant 
District in Block V, Kuripapango Survey District, thence south­
easterly, north-easterly and north-westerly on a line maintained at 
a distance of approximately 270 metres above the boundaries of 
The Lakes to a point on the northern boundary of Section 3, Block 
V, Kuripapango Survey District, thence northerly by a line passing 
below Trigonometrical Station 12363 which approximates the 
western boundary of existing planting to a point on the Tutaekuri 
River (marked E), thence south-easterly along the true left bank of 
that river to a point where it meets the south-eastern comer of part 
Block 130, Patoka Crown Grant District in Block VI, Kuripapango 
Survey District being the boundary of Kaweka State Forest Park, 
thence north-easterly along this boundary being the southern 
boundaries of part Block 130 and part Block 149, Patoka Crown 
Grant District to a point on the southern end of Don Juan Ridge 
in Block V, Patoka Survey District, thence north-easterly along that 
ridge top dropping to a point in Gorge Stream approximately 300 
metres south-east of the common boundary of part Section I, and 
Block 148, Patoka Crown Grant District in Block 1, Patoka Survey 
District, thence easterly along the true left bank of Gorge Stream 
being the southern boundary of Block 148, Patoka Crown Grant 
District to the south-easternmost comer of that Block, thence 
generally north-westerly along the eastern and north boundaries of 
that block, Lot 1 on Deposited Plan 15148, Section 2 and Lot I on 
Deposited Plan 3282 to the north-eastern comer ofthat Lot situated 
in Block I, Patoka Survey District, thence generally north-easterly 
along the eastern boundaries of Pastoral Run II in Block XIII, 
Pohue Survey District and Lot 2 on Deposited Plan 12243 to the 
north-eastern comer of that Lot Block IX, Pohue Survey District, 
south-westerly along the true right bank of the Makahu River being 
the northern boundary of Lot 2 on Deposited Plan 12243 in Block 
IX, Pohue Survey District, thence northerly along the eastern 
boundary of Pastoral Run II to a point where it meets the 
Mangatutunui Stream, thence easterly along the true left bank of 
the Mangatutunui Stream to its confluence with the Mohaka River 
being also the boundary of Pastoral Run II in Block V, Pohue 
Survey District, thence north-westerly along the true right bank of 
the Mohaka River being also part of the northern boundary of 
Pastoral Run II to a point opposite the south-eastern comer of 
section II in Block V, Pohue Survey District, thence generally 
northerly, westerly, north-westerly and south-westerly along the 
eastern, northern and western boundaries of Section II, Block V, 
Pohue Survey District to a point where it meets the Mohaka River, 
thence generally north-westerly along the true right bank of the 
Mohaka River being also the boundary of Pastoral Runs II and 14 
to the south eastern comer of Tapapa No.3 in Block XIII, Kaweka 
Survey District, thence south-westerly along the southern boundary 
of Tapapa No.3 to the point of commencement. 

SECOND SCHEDULE 

HAWKE'S BAY AND WELLINGTON LAND DISTRICTS­
WELLINGTON CONSERVANCy-HAWKE'S BAY AND RANGITIKEI 

COUNTIES 
ALL that area in the Hawke's Bay and Wellington Land Districts, 
Hawke's Bay and Rangitikei Counties containing 7210 hectares, 
more or less, commencing on the boundary of Kaweka State Forest 
Park being the northernmost comer of part Owhaoko C Block in 
Block XII, Taumata Survey District, Wellington Land District, 
thence generally south-westerly and south-easterly along the north­
western and south-western boundaries of part Owhaoka C Block to 
the northern boundary of part Pastoral Run 23 in Block VIII, 
Kuripapango Survey District, Hawke's Bay Land District, then 
south-westerly along the northern boundary of part Pastoral Run 
23 to Trigonometrical Station, Te Whata No.2, thence generally 
south and south-easterly along the western boundary of part Pastoral 
Run 23 to the westernmost comer of Section 1, Block XII, 
Kuripapango Survey District, thence north-easterly, south-easterly 
and southerly along the northern and eastern boundaries of that 
section to the north-western comer of Section 2, thence in a southerly 
direction along the western boundary of that Section, the eastern 
boundary of Section 3, the western boundary of Section 4, the eastern 
boundary of Section 5 and the western boundary of Section 6, Block 
XII, Kuripapango Survey District and continuing in a southerly 
direction along the eastern boundary of Section I, Block II, 
Ngaruroro Survey District, Hawke's Bay Land District, the western 
boundary of Section 2 and part Pastoral Run 23, Block I, Ngaruroro 
Survey District to a point where it meets the Taruarau River, thence 
generally easterly along the true left bank of that river to its 
confluence with the Ngaruroro River also being the southern 
boundary of part Pastoral Run 23 in Block III, Ngaruroro Survey 
District, thence generally south-easterly along the true left bank of 
the Ngaruroro River being also the southern boundary of part 
Pastoral Run 21 to the most southerly part of that Pastoral Run 
Block VII, Ngaruroro Survey District, thence generally northerly 
along the eastern boundary of part Pastoral Run 21 to the south­
eastern comer of Section 6, Block III, Ngaruroro Survey District, 
thence generally north-easterly, westerly and south-westerly along 


