
2118 THE NEW ZEALAND GAZETTE No. 72 

the General Manager of the New Zealand Railways Corporation 
hereby declares that an agreement to that effect having been entered 
into, the land described in the Schedule hereto is hereby acquired 
for and on behalf of Her Majesty the Queen for railway purposes. 

SCHEDULE 

CANTERBURY LAND DISTRICT-HuRUNUI COUNTY 
ALL that piece of land described as follows: 
Area 
m' Being 

4239 Part Rural Section 23813, being part of the land comprised 
and described in certificate of title No. 3C/205, marked 
A on plan. 

Situated in Block I, Stonyhurst Survey District. 
As the same in more particularly delineated on the plan marked 

L.O. 34569 (S.O. 16365), deposited in the office of the New Zealand 
Railways Corporation at Wellington, and thereon marked as above
mentioned. 

Dated at Wellington this 6th day of May 1986. 
A. E. McQUEEN, 

for General Manager, New Zealand Railways Corporation. 
(N.Z.R. L.O. 30743/29) 

1Of! 

Declaring Rai/wa.v Land at Paeroa Now Set Apart for Maori 
Housing Purposes 

PURSUANT to sections 24 and 30 of the New Zealand Railways 
Corporation Act 1981 and section 52 ofthe Public Works Act 1981. 
the General Manager of the New Zealand Railways Corporation 
with the prior written consent of the Minister of Railways hereby 
declares that the land described in the Schedule hereto is hereby 
set apart for Maori housing purposes. 

SCHEDULE 

SOUTH AUCKLAND LAND DISTRICT-PAEROA BOROUGH 
ALL those pieces of land described as follows: 
Area 
m' 
872 

1003 

1018 

997 

Railway land being 
Lot II, D.P. S. 30869, being all the land comprised and 

described in certificate of title No. 27D/1176. 
Lot 10, D.P. S. 30869, being all the land comprised and 

described in certificate of title No. 27D/1175. 
Lot 13, D.P. S. 30870, being all the land comprised and 

described in certificate of title No. 27D/I178. 
Lot 24, D.P. S. 30870, being all the land comprised and 

described in certificate of title No. 27D/1186. 
Situated in Block XIII, Ohinemuri Survey District. 
Dated at W"lIington this 7th day of May 1986. 

. A. E. McQUEEN, 
for General Manager, New Zealand Railways Corporation. 

(N.Z.R. L.O. I I 292/B I 7 /5, N.Z.R. L.O. 11292/BI8/5, N.Z.R. L.O. 
I I 292/B22/5, N.Z.R. L.O. I I 292/A3I 2f7) 

1011 

Rel'ocation of Consent to the Distribution of a Medicine 
. I-

I 
PURSUANT to section 35 (I) (b) of the Medicines Act 1981, the 
Minister of Health hereby revokes consent to the distribution of 
"Crescormon" human growth hormone in New Zealand. 

Dated this 29th day of April 1986. 
RUSSELL MARSHALL, for Minister of Health. 

10 

The Christchurch Teachers College Council Notice 1984. 
Amendment No.1 

PURSUANT to section 67B of the Education Act 1964, the Minister 
of Education. hereby gives the following notice: 

NOTICE 
I. This notice shall be cite" as the Christchurch Teachers College 

Council Notice 1984, Amendment No. I and shall be read together 
and deemed part of the Christchurch Teachers College Council 
Notice 1984* (hereinafter referred to as the principal notice). 

2. This notice shall come into force on th6 date of its publication 
in the Gazette. 

3. Clause 2, subclause I (c) of the principal notice is amended by 
deleting the words "One member" and substituting the words "Two 
members". 

4. Clause 2, subclause I (j) of the principal notice is amended by 
deleting the words "One member" and substituting the words "Two 
members each". 

5. Clause 2, subclause I (k) of the principal notice is amended by 
deleting the words "One member" and substituting the words "Two 
members each". 

6. Clause 2, subclause I (I) of the principal notice is amended by 
deleting the number "2" and substituting the number "3". 

Dated at Wellington this 10th day of April 1986. 
RUSSELL MARSHALL, Minister of Education. 

*Gazette, No. 80, 17 May 1984, page 1611. 

Replacement Schools for Wanaka Area School 

10 

PURSUANT to section 154 (I) of the Education Act 1964, notice is 
given that Wanaka Primary School and Mount Aspiring College 
have been designated as replacement schools for Wanaka Area 
School. 

This notice shall come into effect on the date it is published in 
the New Zealand Gazette. 

Dated at Wellington this 11th day of April 1986. 
RUSSELL MARSHALL, Minister of Education. 

10 

Import Control Exemption Notice (No.4) 1986 

PuRSUANT to regulation 17 of the Import Control Regulations 1973* 
the Minister of Trade and Industry hereby gives the following notice. 

NOTICE 
I. (I) This notice may be cited as the Import Control Exemption 

Notice (No.4) 1986. 
(2) This notice shall come into force on the 16th day of May 

1986. 
2. Goods of the classes specified in the Schedule hereto, imported 

from and being the produce or manufacture of any country, are 
hereby exempted from the requirement of a licence under the said 
regulations. 
*S.R. 1973/86 

Amendment No. I : S.R. 1977/14 
Amendment No.2: S.R. 1977/289 
Amendment No.3: S.R. 1980/246 
Amendment No.4: S.R. 1985/61 
Amendment No.5: S.R. 1985/186 

SCHEDULE 

CLASSES OF GOODS 
A motor vehicle, which is the personal property of the importer, 
and has been owned and used by the owner overseas prior to delivery 
for export to New Zealand. Provided that only I vehicle per person 
may be imported in any 12-month period . 

Dated at Wellington this 12th day of May 1986. 
DAVID CA YGILL, 

Minister of Trade and Industry. 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 
THIS exemption notice provides for the exemption of passengers' 
motor vehicles owned and used overseas. 

6 

The Traffic (Lake County) Notice No.1. 1986 

PURSUANT to the Transport Act 1962, the delegation from the 
Minister of Transport, and a subdelegation from the Secretary for 
Transport, I, Carne Maurice Clissold, Chief Traffic Engineer' give 
the following notice: 

NOTICE 
THIS notice may be cited as the Traffic (Lake County) Notice No. I, 
1986. 


