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boundary (including the crossing of a road) to the south-eastern 
boundary of Lot 1 DP 58263; thence westerly along the northern 
boundary of Lot 1, DP 13663 to the western boundary of Lot 1, 
DP 58263; thence northerly along the last-mentioned boundary to 
the northernmost point of Lot 1, DP 26422; thence south-westerly 
along the north-western boundaries of Lot 1 aforesaid and Section 
7, Block VIII, Wainuioru Survey District and the production of 
the last-mentioned boundary to the middle of the Kuamahanga 
Stream; thence generally north-westerly down the middle of that 
stream, to and generally westerly down the middle of the 
Wainuioru River to a point in line with the south-western bound­
ary of Section 7, Westmere Settlement; thence generally north­
westerly to and along that boundary, the south-western boundary 
of Section 1, Westmere Settlement and its production to the 
middle of West mere Road; thence north-easterly along the middle 
of that road to a point in line with the southern boundary of 
Section 1, Block XIV, Otahoua Survey District; thence westerly to 
and along that boundary the north-western boundaries of the said 
Section 1, Lots 3 and 2, DP 1569, part Lot 1, DP 1569, Lot 3, DP 
22775, and Lot 1, DP 49498, to the western boundary of Section 3, 
Block XI, Otahoua Survey District; thence north-westerly along 
the last-mentioned boundary and the south-western boundary of 
Section 2, Block XI, aforesaid and the production of the last­
mentioned boundary to the middle of the Pohatu Stream; thence 
generally north-westerly down the middle of that stream to and 
generally north-easterly up the middle of the Tauweru River to a 
point in line with the eastern boundary of part Section 5, Tauweru 
District (CT 330/24); thence generally northerly to and along that 
boundary and its production to the middle of the Masterton­
Castlepoint Road; thence westerly along the middle of that road 
and its production to the middle ofthe Ruamahanga River; thence 
generally north-westerly up the middle of that river to a point in 
line with the north-western boundary of part Section 9, Block IV, 
Mikimiki Survey District; thence north-easterly along a right line 
bearing 39°05' to the northern boundary of part Section 9 afore­
said; thence north-westerly by a right line bearing 287° to the 
southern boundary of Section 4, Block XIII, Tararua Survey Dis­
trict; thence generally westerly along the boundary of Section 4 
aforesaid to Tri~ Station K, Tawhero; thence north-westerly along 
a right line beanng 298° to a point of intersection with a right line 
between Trig Station I, Mount Dundas and Trig Station AA, 
Arawaru; thence generally north-easterly along that right line to 
Trig Station AA, Arawaru; thence generally north-easterly along 
right lines to Trig Station F, Marima, and the north-western comer or Section 9, Block IX, Mangahao Survey District; thence north­
easterly along the north-western boundaries of In~is Road, Sec­
tion 4, Block V, Mangahao Survey District and Sections 3, 2 and I, 
Block VI, Mangahao Survey District to the southern comer of 
Section 13, Block XIX, Mangahao Survey District; thence north­
westerly along the south-western boundary of that section to the 
westernmost comer of the said Section 13; thence generally 
northerly along the eastern side of South Range Road to Pahiatua­
Aokautere Road (Pahiatua Track); thence northerly along a right 
line to and along the eastern side of North Range Road; thence 
generally northerly to the south-western comer of part Section 1, 
Block I, Mangahao Survey District (CT 247/81); thence northerly 
along the western boundaries of part Section I aforesaid and Sec­
tion 47, Block I, Mangahao Survey District and the production of 
the last-mentioned boundary to the middle of the Manawatu 
River; thence westerly down the middle of that river to a point in 
line with the south-eastern boundary of Section 1, Block X, 
Manchester District; thence north-easterly to and along that 
boundary, and the south-eastern boundaries of Lot 2, DP 27494, 
and part Lot 2, DP 239 (including the crossings of Saddle Road) 
and its production to the middle of Whariti Road; thence generally 
south-easterly along the middle of that road to a point in line with 
the western boundary of Section 2, Block II, Gorge Survey Dis­
trict; thence northerly, easterly, and southerly to and along the 
western, northern, and eastern boundaries of the said Section 2, to 
the southernmost comer of Part Section 52, Block XIV, Pohangina 
Survey District; thence north-easterly along the south-eastern 
boundary of the said Part Section 52, to the northern comer of 
Section 6, Block VII, Gorge Survey District; thence south-easterly 
along the north-eastern boundary of that section to Trig Station 
60A, Wharite, in Block VII aforesaid; thence generally northerly 
along the summit of the Ruahine Range. to Trig Station IS, in 
Block XVI, Pukeokahu Survey District; thence northerly generally 
along the summit of the Ruahine Range to its intersection with a 
right line between Trig Station 30 (AoraniP) in Block XI, Puke­
okahu Survey District (Wellington Land DIstrict) and the conflu­
ence of the Makaroro River and the Makaroro Stream in Block IX, 
Wakarara Survey District (Hawke'S Bay Land District); thence 
south-westerly along that right line to the said confluence; thence 
easterly along a right line to a point in the middle of the Man­
gamouku Stream due north of the northernmost point of Lot 1, DP 
16107 in Block XI, Wakarara Survey District; thence south-east­
erly generally down the middle of the Mangamauku Stream to a 
pomt in line with the western boundary of Block I, Gwavas Crown 
Grant District; thence northerly generally to and along that bound­
ary, the western boundaries of Block 5, again Block 1 and Block 3, 
all Gwavas Crown Grant District; thence easterly generally along 

the northern boundary of that Block 3, along a right line across 
Kereru Road to and again along that said northern boundary and 
its production to and down the middle of the Mangaonuku S~ream 
to a point in line with the north-western boundary of SectIon 7, 
Block X, Maraekakaho Survey District; thence south-easterly 
along a right line to the northernmost comer of Section 1, Block 
XIV Maraekakaho Survey District and along the north-eastern 
bou~daries of that section to the north-western side of Te Onepu 
Road, along a right line to and along the north-eastern boundaries 
of Section 1, Block XV, Maraekakaho Survey District, part Lot 29, 
DP 4416 and Lot 5, DP 5103 and the production of the last­
mentioned boundary to the middle of SH 2; thence northerly along 
the middle of that highway to a point in line with the middle of 
Boundary Road; thence generally south-easterly along the middle 
of Boundary Road and Te Aute Trust Road to a point in line with 
the south-western boundary of Pat an gat a 2El Block; thence south­
easterly generally to and along that boundary and the production 
of that boundary to the middle of Middle Road; thence northerly 
along the middle of Middle Road to the intersection of that road 
with Papanui Stream; thence up the middle of that stream to a 
point of line with the south-western boundary of Patangata 2Kl 
Block; thence south-easterly to and along that boundary and its 
production of that boundary to the middle of the Tukituki River; 
thence up the middle of that river to and down the middle of the 
Hawea Stream to a point in line with the eastern boundary of Lot 
1, DP 3009; thence southerly generally along that boundary and 
the eastern boundary of Lot 2, DP 3009 and the north-eastern 
bouIluiuy of Lot 3, DP 3009 and its production of that boundary 
to the middle of the Hawea Stream; thence up the middle of that 
stream to a point in line with the northern boundary of Lot 1, DP 
14568; thence easterly to and along that boundary to Kahuranaki 
Road and along a nght line to the northern boundary of part 
Section 4, Block III, Oero Survey District to the easternmost cor­
ner of the last-mentioned part Section 4; thence southerly along 
the eastern boundaries of that part Section 4, Sections 16, 6 and 
14, Block III, Oero Survey District to Waipoapoa Road and along 
a right line to the north-eastern comer of Section 46, Block VII, 
Oero Survey District, again southerly along the eastern boundary 
of that last-mentioned Section 46 to the southern boundary of Lot 
1, DP 3215; thence easterly and northerly along the southern and 
eastern boundaries of Lot 1, DP 3215 to and easterly along the 
northern boundary of Lot 2, DP 3216 and the production of the 
last-mentioned boundary to the eastern side of Te Apiti Road; 
thence easterly along that boundary and its production of that 
boundary to the sea coast; thence generally south-westerly along 
the mean high water mark of the sea coast to the point of 
commencement. 

MANAWATU 
All that area commencing from Trig Station AA Arawaru in Block 
VII, Arawaru Survey District and proceeding generally north-east­
erly along right lines to Trig Station F, Marima and the north­
western comer of Section 9, Block IX, Mangahao Survey District; 
thence north-easterly along the north-western boundaries of Inglis 
Road, Section 4, Block V, Mangahao Survey District and Sections 
3, 2 and 1, Block VI, Mangahao Survey DIstrict, to the southern 
comer of Section 13, Block XIX, Mangahao Survey District; 
thence north-westerly along the south-western boundary of that 
section to the westernmost comer of the said Section 13; thence 
generally northerly along the eastern side of South Range Road to 
Pahiatua-Aokautere Road (Pahiatua Track); thence northerly 
along a right line to and along the eastern side of North Range 
Road to the south-western comer of Part Section I, Block I, Man­
gahao Survey District (CT 247/81); thence northerly along the 
western boundaries of Part Section I aforesaid and Section 47, 
Block I, Mangahao Survey District and the production of tl.e last­
mentioned boundary to the middle of the Manawatu River; thence 
generally westerly down the middle of that river and the bounda­
ries of the Electoral District of Rangitikei hereinbefore described, 
to the junction of the middle of SH 56 and the middle of the Oroua 
River; thence generally southerly down the middle of that river 
and the Manawatu River to its intersection with the middle of the 
Tokomaru River; thence generally easterly up the middle of that 
river to its tributary coincidental with the southern boundary of 
Section I, Block X, Arawaru Survey District; thence generally 
northerly along the middle of the said tributary to its intersection 
with the northern boundary of the said Section 1; thence easterly 
along that boundary to its intersection with an unnamed legal 
road; thence by a right line due east to the middle of the said road; 
thence generally southerly along the middle of the said road to a 
point in line Wlth the easternmost comer of Section 10, Block X, 
Arawaru Survey District; thence southerly by a right line to and 
along the eastern boundaries of the said Section 10 and Sections 1 
and 2, Block X, Arawaru Survey District, to the western boundary 
of Part Manawatu-Kukutauaki 2A; thence northerly along the last­
mentioned boundary and Part Mangahao No 1 to the point of 
commencement; excluding therefrom the Electoral District of 
Palmerston North hereinafter described. 

PALMERSTON NORTH 
All that area bounded by a line commencing at the north-western 
comer of Lot 49, DP 49366 situated in the City of Palmerston 


