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in certificate of title, Volume 6A, folio 371 (Wellington 
Registry). 

Dated at Wellington this 30th day of May 1988. 

W. P. JEFFRIES, Minister of Transport. 

(M.O.T. 43116/6) 
go6359 

Sale of Taranaki Harbours Board Land 

I, William Patrick Jeffries, Minister of Transport, having 
obtained the concurrence of the Minister of Finance pursuant 
to section 143A (3) of the Harbours Act 1950, hereby approve 
pursuant to section 143A (1) (a) and section 143c (1) (b) (i) of 
the Act, the sale of land described in the Schedule by the 
Taranaki Harbours Board; and I specify that my approval is 
effective from the date of this notice. 

Schedule 
All that parcel of land containing 455 square metres (455 m2), 
more or less, situate in the City of New Plymouth, being Lot 1 
on Deposited Plan 15770, being part of Mount Eliot Harbour 
Reserve, Town of New Plymouth, and being all of the land 
comprised and described in certificate of title, Volume H2, 
folio 606 (Taranaki Registry). 

Dated at Wellington this 21st day of March 1988. 

W. P. JEFFRIES, Minister of Transport. 

(M.O.T. 43/12/6) 
go6358 

Traffic Regulations 1976 

Approval of Motorcycle Safety Helmets in Terms of 
the Traffic Regulations 1976 
Pursuant to subclause (1) of regulation 88 of the Traffic 
Regulations 1976 and pursuant to powers delegated to me by 
the Secretary for Transport by an instrument of delegation 
dated the 3rd day of August 1987, motorcycle safety helmets 
of the make and type described in the Schedule hereto are 
hereby approved for the purposes of regulation 31 of the said 
regulations. 

Schedule 
Safety helmets manufactured by FIMEZ S.p.A Italy, complying 
with ECE Regulation 22.02 and marked accordingly, and 
bearing the model designations: 

Galactica Rider 
Grand Prix Rider 2 
Mistral FX Start 

PL Trophy 
Mixer FY New Jet 

PL Targa 
Race 

Dated at Wellington this 8th day of June 1988. 

R. L. REYNOLDS, Senior Automotive Engineer. 

(M.O.T. 17/6/1) 
go6294 

Approval of Motorcycle Safety Helmets in Terms of 
the Traffic Regulations 1976 

Pursuant to subclause (1) of regulation 88 of the Traffic 
Regulations 1976 and pursuant to powers delegated to me by 
the Secretary for Transport by an instrument of delegation 
dated the 3rd day of August 1987. motorcycle safety helmets 
of the make and type described in the Schedule hereto are 
hereby approved for the purposes of regulation 31 of the said 
regulations. 

Schedule 
Safety helmets manufactured by AGV S.p.A Italy, complying 
with AS1698 and marked accordingly, and bearing the model 
designations: 

X 15 
X 99911 X 999/2 
X 1000/E X 100011 X 1000/2 
X 7011 X 70/3 
c X 5000 
AG 100 
KR 2001/E 

Dated at Wellington this 8th day of June 1988. 

R. L. REYNOLDS, Senior Automotive Engineer. 

(M.O.T. 17/6/1) 
go6296 

Transport Act 1962 

Transport Licensing Authority Sitting 
Pursuant to the Transport Act 1962, the No.9 and 
Christchurch District Transport Licensing Authority (I. P. 
Wollerman). gives notice of the receipt of the following 
applications and will hold a public sitting on the date and at 
the place and times shown to hear evidence for and against 
granting them. Hearing to commence at 9.30 a.m. at the 
Conference Room, Ministry of Transport Building, corner 
Cas he I and Montreal Streets, Christchurch. 

Commencing at 9.30 a.m. 

A08/88/01640 Cunningham Passenger Service Ltd., 179 
Palmerston Street, Westport. Application to add a route to 
licence No. 3919. 

Timetable and route: 

Depart 

Arrive 
Depart 

Westport 
Reefton 
Springs Junction 
Springs Junction 
Reefton 
Westport 

11.00 a.m. 
12.15 p.m. 

1.00 p.m. 
1.30 p.m. 
2.15 p.m. 
3.30 p.m. 

A09/88/01644 Mayne William Manson, 114 Richardson 
Terrace, Christchurch. Application for a Goods Service 
Licence. 

A09/88/01854 Kevin Murray Hobson, 2 Alport Place, 
Christchurch 2. Application for the transfer of Continuous 
Taxicab Service Licence No. 10556 from Leslie Muir 
Tavendale. 

Commencing at 10.30 a.m. 

A09/88/01851 Canterbury Cabs Ltd., 21 Shakespeare Road, 
Christchurch. Application for the transfer of Continuous 
Taxicab Service Licence No. 10331 from Manuel Wilfred Te 
Amo. An amendment to Special Condition (i) is sought by the 
deletion of the reference to Blue Star Taxis (Christchurch) 
SOCiety Ltd., and its substitution Gold Band Taxis (Chch) 
SOCiety Ltd. 

A09/88/01900 Peter Charles Abrams, 23 Torquay Street, 
Christchurch. Application for the transfer of Continuous 
Taxicab Service Licence No. 10371 from Brian John 
Hammond. An amendment of Special Condition (i) is sought 
by the deletion of the reference to Blue Star TaxiS 
(Christchurch) Society Ltd. and its substitution Gold Band 
TaxiS (Chch) SOCiety Ltd. 

A09/88/01907 Christchurch Taxis Ltd., 21 Shakespeare 
Road, Christchurch. Application for a Passenger Service 
Licence. 

Further particulars regarding the above applications are 
available from the Secretary hereunder at the offices of the 
Ministry of Transport Building, Private Bag, Christchurch. 


