
14 APRIL NEW ZEALAND GAZETTE 1465 

Spain 
Sri Lanka 
Sweden 
Switzerland 
Taiwan 
Thailand 
Tonga 
United Kingdom 
U.S.A. 
West Germany 
Western Samoa 

Value of One NZ Dollar 

72.95 Peseta 
19.88 Rupee 

3.89 Krona 
.91 Franc 

18.89 Twn Dollar 
16.45 Baht 

.88 Pa'anga 

.35 Pound 

.66 Dollar 
1.10 Mark 
1.33 Tala 

Dated at Wellington this 12th day of April 1988. 
M. W. TAYLOR, Comptroller of Customs. 
g03874 

Internal Affairs 
Civil Defence Act 1983 

Reappointment of Disaster Recovery Co-ordinator 
Pursuant to section 69 (2) of the Civil Defence Act 1983, I, 
Michael Bassett, Minister of Civil Defence, hereby reappoint 
John Kinloch McKenzie as Disaster Recovery Co·ordinator for 
the East Cape Region for a term of 28 days effective from 
Tuesday, 5 April 1988. 
The disaster recovery co-ordinator shall exercise the functions, 
duties and powers contained in section 72 of the Civil Defence 
Act 1983. 
Dated at Wellington this 5th day of March 1988. 
MICHAEL BASSETT, Minister of Civil Defence. 
g03855 

dustice 
Criminal dustice Act 1985 

Confiscation of Motor Vehicle 
Pursuant to section 84 of the Criminal Justice Act 1985, an 
order of confiscation was made In the District Court at New 
Plymouth on 3 March 1988, against Christopher Bay Schuller 
in respect of a Holden Belmont motor vehicle, registration 
No. HK. 8644. 
Dated at New Plymouth this 7th day of April 1988. 

G. B. SHAW, Deputy Registrar. 
g03848 

Confiscation of Motor Vehicle 
Pursuant to section 84 (2) of the Criminal Justice Act 1985, an 
order was made in the District Court at Christchurch on 
Thursday, 24 March 1988 against Wayne Rangi Reihana for 
the confiscation of the following motor vehicle: 

Holden, Registration No. GD 9024. 
P. B. MILES, Deputy Registrar. 
g03844 

District Courts Act 1947 

Acting District Court Judge Appointed 
Pursuant to section lOA of the District Courts Act 1947, His 
Excellency the Governor-General has been pleased to appoint 

Trevor Robert Gillies, resigned District Court Judge of 
Auckland 

to be an acting District Court Judge, to exercise civil and 

criminal jurisdiction in New Zealand and the jurisdiction of the 
Children and Young Persons Courts for a term of 2 years on 
and from 5 April 1988. 

Dated at Wellington this 24th day of March 1988. 

GEOFFREY PALMER, Minister of Justice. 
g03857 

Acting District Court Judge Appointed 
Pursuant to section 5 of the District Courts Act 1947 and 
section 21 of the Children and Young Persons Act 1974, His 
Excellency the Governor-General has been pleased to appoint 

Barry Neil Morris, barrister and solicitor of Auckland 

to be an acting District Court Judge, to exercise civil and 
criminal jurisdiction in New Zealand and the jurisdiction of the 
Children and Young Persons Court for a term of 12 months on 
and from 29 February 1988. 

Dated at Wellington this 29th day of February 198B. 

GEOFFREY PALMER, Minister of Justice. 
g03858 

Sharebrokers Amendment Act 1981 

The New Zealand Stock Exchange Rules 1983 

PAUL REEVES, Governor-General 

At Wellington this 11th day of April 1988 

Present: 

HIS EXCELLENCY THE GOVERNOR·GENERAL IN COUNCIL 

Pursuant to section 7 (3) of the Sharebrokers Amendment Act 
1981, His Excellency the Governor-General, acting by and 
with the adVice and consent of the Executive Council, hereby 
approves the following amendments to the Rules of the New 
Zealand Stock Exchange. 
Rule 3_0312 

Rule 3.0312 is amended by omitting the expression 
"$50,000" and substituting the expression "$100,000". 

Rule 6_05 

Omit this rule and substitute the following rule: 

"6.05 At all times during the period of his membership: 

6.051 Every indiVidual member who does not have trading 
floor representation shall ensure that his assets exceed his 
liabilities by such sum (not being less than $100,000) as may 
from time to time be determined by the Executive for the 
purposes of this rule; 

6. 052 Every individual member who does have trading 
floor representation shall ensure that his assets exceed his 
liabilities by such sum (not being less than $200,000) as may 
from time to time be determined by the Executive for the 
purposes of this rule; 

6.053 The Executive may accept a guarantee as part of the 
member's assets." 

Rule 6_1031 

Rule 6.1031 is amended by omitting the expression 
"$500,000" and substituting the expression "$1,000,000". 

Rule 6.1032 

Omit this rule and substitute the following rule: 
"6.1032 If the company has trading floor representation, 

the sum derived by multiplying $200,000 by the number of 
individual ordinary members of the Exchange who are the 
beneficial and registered owners of the voting shares of the 
company; 

6.1033 If the company does not have trading floor 
representation, the sum derived by multiplying $100,000 by 
the number of individual ordinary members of the Exchange 


