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Macdiarmed, Robert Murray, first and final dividend of
46.1677c in the dollar.

Mace, Lindsey Joy, first and final dividend of 0.429c in the
dollar.

Martin, Neil William, first and final dividend of 71.80645c in
the dollar.

Miller, Keith, interim dividend of 80c in the dollar.

Nicholls, Neal Medhurst, first and final dividend of l.l643c
in the dollar.

Price, Daryl L, supplementary dividend of 10.7777c in the
dollar (making in all 19.L277c in the dollar).

Quixley, Michael Colin, first and final dividend of 0.63c in
the dollar.

Solofa, Taai, first and final dividend of 60.7084c in the dollar.

Thomson, Ronald Peter, first and final dividend of 81.1512c
in the dollar.

Thompson, Michael John, first and final dividend of 2.33c in
the dollar.

Watson, James John, first and final dividend of 2.1352c in
the dollar.

T. W. PAIN, Deputy Assignee.

Sixth Floor, Justice Departmental Buitding, 3 Kingston Street,
Auckland 1.

ba13141

Lynn, Graeme Leonard Edwin, sickness beneficiary of 773
Ferry Road, Christchurch, previously of 30 Kowhai Terrace,
Christchurch, was adjudicated bankrupt at the High Court,
Christchurch. Date of Adjudication: 26 July 1989.

Harris, Richard Claude, unemployed steel placer of Flat 4,
30 Edgeware Road, Christchurch, previously of Washington
Valley, Nelson, was adjudicated bankrupt at the High Court,
Christchurch. Date of Adjudication:27 July 1989.

Rolston, Ruth, kitchen hand care of Junior Ranks Mess,
Burnham Camp, Burnham, was adjudicated bankrupt at the
High Court, Christchurch. Date of Adjudication:3t July 1989.

Billing, Graham John, invalids beneficiary of 2/31 Worcester
Street, Christchurch, previously of 3/97 Cranford Street,
Christchurch, was adjudicated bankrupt at the High Court,
Christchurch. Date of Adjudication: I August 1989.

Gray, Desmond Russell, sickness beneficiary of 77
Barbadoes Street, Christchurch, previously of 5 Beattey
Street, Christchurch, was adjudicated bankrupt at the High
Court, Christchurch. Dafe of Adjudication: 7 August 1989.

Dates of first meeting of creditors will be advertised later.

J. G. ROLLINSON, Deputy Official Assignee.

Commercial Affairs Division, Christchurch.

trading in partnership as Chinatown Gift Centre, 69 The Mall,
Cromwell, was adjudged bankrupt on 7 August 1989.

Hayes, Colin William, health worker of 62 Royal Terrace,
Alexandra, was adludged bankrupt on 8 August 1989.

Harding, Jo-Ann Trudy, beneficiary of 81 Dunbeath
Crescent, Invercargill, formerly of 472 Ness Street and 54
Tanner Street, Invercargill, was adjudged bankrupt on 8
August 1989.

Maniopoto, Nigel Ross, unemployed of 13 Denton Street,
Gore, formerly of 26 Akatea Street, Wanganui, was adjudged
bankrupt on 9 August 1989.

Young, Christopher Paul, contractor of Flat 4, 50 City Road,
Dunedin, previously trading as Hortcare Products, was
adjudged bankrupt on 9 August 1989. Date of creditors
meeting to be advised.

Scott, John Ridgeweill, unemployed, care of 2/29 Koninl
Street, Timaru, was adjudged bankrupt on 9 August 1989.

T. E. IAING. Official Assignee.

Commercial Affairs Division, Dunedin.

Notice is hereby given that dividends have been paid in my
office in all claims in the following estates:

Batters, Charles Malcolm, first and final dividend of 100c in
the dollar plus interest.

Burdett, Les, first and final dividend of 100c in the dollar plus
interest.

Cole, Anrienne, second and final dividend of 2.314c in the
dollar (making in all 55.1175c in the dollar).

Corkill, Stephen Peter, first and final dividend of 72.8528cin
the dollar.

Cornor, Sifa Hele Maitoga, first and final divideird of 100c in
the dollar plus interest.

Cunningham, Ross Andrew, first and final dividend of
6.69527c in the dollar.

Ebbett, Bruce Alfred Norman, first and final dividend of
4.275c in the dollar.

Friend, Brian Norman, first and final dividend of 100c in the
dollar plus interest.

Hayes, Robert Steven, second and final dividend of 24.7187c
in the dollar (making in all 84.1181c in the dollar).

Henman, Gary R., first and final dividend of 27.77125c ln lhe
dollar.

Jamieson, Cecil Thomas, first and final dividend of 3.825c in
the dollar.

Kira, Andrew, first and final dividend of 18.718c in the dollar.

Knox, Bryan lan, first and final dividend of 0.00427c in the
dollar.

Leung, Ming Chung and Judy Dorothy, trading as Fountain
Court Seafood Restaurant (partnership), first and final
dividend of 5.27c in the dollar.

Cornpany Notices

APPOINTMENT OF RECEIVERS

In the matter of. 47 South Chinook (NZ) Ltd., a duly
incorporated company having its registered office at

Invercargill and in the matter of a debenture issued by 47
South Chinook (NZ) Ltd. (hereinafter called "the


