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General

New Zealand Post Treaty of Waitangi Act 1975

State Owned Enterprises Act 1986

Treaty of Waitangi Act 1975

State Owned Enterprises Act 1986

Notice is given that New Zealand Post Limited has applied to
the Waitangi Tribunal under section 8o of the Treaty of
Waitangi Act 1975 to recommend that the land described
below, be no longer liable to resumption by the Crown on
behalf of any Maori claimants to the Waitangi Tribunal.

The land is former Crown land transferred to New Zealand
Post Limited by section 23 of the State Owned Enterprises Act
1986, situated at State Highway 1, Albany, Auckland. The
legal description is 809 square metres, being Lot 15,
D.P.38729, part Allotment 28, Parish of Paremoremo, being
all certificate of title 69A1508, North Auckland Land District,
being the former Post Office Albany site.

Any Maori who considers that he or she or any group of Maori
of which he or she is a member have grounds for a claim in
respect of the land under section 6 of the Treaty of Waitangi
Act 1975 must submit a claim to the Waitangi Tribunal before
the 7th day of December 1989, and may post that claim to the
Registrar, Waitangi Tribunal, P.O. Box 7O-0M, The Terrace,
Wellington.

If no claim in relation to the land is submitted to the Waitangi
Tribunal before the 7th day of December 1989, the Tribunal
may recommend that the land or interest in land be no longer
liable to resumption under section 27s ol the State Owned
Enterprises Act 1986.

Dated at Wellington this 11th day of August 1989.

H. C. PARKER, Managing Director.

New Zealand Post Limited.
gnl5065

He whakaatu tenei kua tono a New Zealand Post Limited ki te
Roopu Whakamana i te Tiriti o Waitangi i raro i te tekiona 8o
o te Treaty of Waitangi Act 1975 kia tono ki te Kawanatanga
kia kaua e riro ano te whenua kua whakahuatia i raro iho nei, i
raro i te mana o te Karauna mo nga Maori e tuku kereme ana
ki te Roopu Whakamana i te Tiriti o Waitangi.

Ko te whenua, i raro i te mana o te Karauna i ona wa, i
whakawhitia ki a New Zealand Post Limited i raro i te tekiona
23 o te State Owned Enterprises Act 1986 (i raro ranei i tetahi
atu wahanga o te Ture nei). Ko te whenua nei kei State
Highway 1, Albany, Auckland, te wahi tunga i te poutapeta o
Albany i mua, e mohiotia nei hoki ko te ingoa i raro i te ture
809 square metres, being Lot 15, D.P.38729, part Allotment
28, Parish of Paremoremo, being all certificate of title
69A/508, North Auckland land District.

Mehemea tetahi Maori e whakapono ana e ahei ana ia, tetahi
ropu Maori ranei e whaipanga atu ana ia, ki te whakatakoto
kereme ki taua whenua i raro i te tekiona 6 o te Treaty of
Waitangi Act7975, me whakatakoto kereme atu ia ki te Ropu
Whakamana i te Tiriti o Waitangi i mua o te 7th o nga ra o
December 1989, a ka ahei ki te tuku i taua kereme ki te
Kairehita o te Roopu Whakamana i te Tiriti o Waitangi,
Pouaka Poutapeta 70-0M, Te Whanga-Nui-a-Tara.

Mehemea kaore e tukua atu he kereme mo taua whenua ki te
Roopu Whakamana i te Tiriti o Waitangi i mua o te 7th o nga
ra o December 7989, kei te Roopu Whakamana i te Tiriti o
Waitangi te mana ki te tono kia kaua te Karauna e whaiwahi
atu ano ki taua whenua, ki tetahi wahanga ranei o taua
whenua, i raro i te tekiona 27s o le State Owned Enterprises
Act 1986.

I hainatia i Wellington i te 1lth o nga ra o August 1989.

R. M. INGLE, Managing Director.

New Zealand Post Limited.
9n15066


