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his admission a principal or director of a sharebroking 
business and wishes to continue to operate that business as a 
sharebroking firm in terms of these Rules, shall first satisfy 
the Board that he and his business are able to meet the 
criteria set out in Rule 7.06. 

7.08 A member wishing to open further sharebroking offices in 
addition to his principal place of sharebroking business or to 
join in partnership or become formally associated with 
another member shall give the Exchange at least 21 days' 
written notice of his intention to do so. In the case of a 
sharebroking office, the notice shall state the full address of 
the office and the full names of the person or persons under 
whose direct full time control it will be placed. On receipt of 
any such notice the Executive Director shall forthwith advise 
all members of its details. 

7.09 A member shall be entitled to participate either in person 
or through an authorised clerk in the official trading 
meetings of any regional exchange whether or not he 
belongs to that regional exchange, so long as the member 
has paid such fees and levies as the committee of that 
regional exchange shall reasonably determine and has a 
sharebroking office in the territory of that regional 
exchange. 

7 .10 Where a member has more than one sharebroking office, 
contract notes may be issued from any one of the member's 
sharebroking offices in New Zealand but deliveries to the 
member shall be made to the regional exchange nominated 
by the member for that purpose unless otherwise agreed 
between the parties. 

7 .11 Where a member has a sharebroking office situated 
overseas: 

7 .111 Subject to Rule 7 .112, the provisions of these Rules 
which relate to the operation of sharebroking offices shall 
apply in respect of that overseas sharebroking office 
except in so far as they conflict with any requirements 
whether statutory or otherwise that apply in the 
jurisdiction in which that sharebroking office is situated; 

7 .112 Rule 23 shall apply in respect of that sharebroking 
office as if that office were in the territory of the member's 
regional exchange, except that an inspector appointed 
under Rule 23.04 may appoint an overseas chartered 
accountant in public practice as his agent and delegate to 
him any or all of his powers as inspector in relation to that 
sharebroking office. 

8.0 Board of Directors 

8.01 The management and control of the business and affairs 
of the Exchange shall be in the hands of a Board of 
Directors ("the Board"). The powers of the Board shall be 
subject only to such limitations as are expressly imposed by 
these rules. 

8.02 The Board shall consist of 10 persons of whom at least 5 
shall be individual members of the Exchange, at least 2 shall 
be non-members and a maximum of 2 may be full-time 
employees of the Exchange who shall be appointed by the 
Board at the recommendation of the Chairman. 

8.03 All appointments to the Board, other than that of any 
full-time employee of the Exchange, shall be by election at 
the annual meeting of members and such appointees shall 
be subject to nomination as specified by these Rules. 

8.04 Nominations for member appointees to the Board shall 
be made by two other individual members and submitted in 
writing to the Executive Director no later than five weeks 
prior to the date of the annual meeting. All persons 
nominated shall confirm in writing to the Executive Director 
their willingness to accept nomination. 

8.05 No person who is not a member other than any full-time 
employee of the Exchange appointed in terms of Rule 8.02, 
shall be eligible for election to the Board unless he has first 
been nominated by the Chairman and he has suitable 

business experience (as determined by the Board). Any 
person so nominated shall signify in writing his willingness 
to accept the nomination and the nomination shall be 
submitted in writing to the Executive Director no later than 
five weeks prior to the date of the annual meeting. 

A non-member Director elected to the Board shall: 

8.051 Not be employed concurrently in any office of the 
New Zealand Stock Exchange or any of its member firms; 

8.052 Be entitled to all information and any notices 
circulated to members and may attend, but not vote, at 
general meetings of members; 

8.053 Not by reason of his election become a member of the 
Exchange. 

8.06 All directors shall be entitled to remuneration at such a 
rate or by such sum as the members may at any general 
meeting from time to time determine. The remuneration so 
determined shall apply to the year specified in such 
determination and to all subsequent years until altered by 
the members in general meeting. 

8.07 The remuneration shall not be altered unless notice of 
intention to move accordingly stating the amount of the 
proposed increase or decrease has been given in the notice 
convening the relevant meeting. 

8.08 The remuneration of the Directors may be fixed 
individually or collectively or by both of such means. 
Remuneration payable to any Directors collectively shall be 
divided amongst them in such proportions and in such 
manner as they may determine, and in default of such 
determination shall be divided amongst them equally. 

8.09 The Directors shall be entitled to be paid reasonable 
expenses incurred in attending meetings of the Board and 
whenever else engaged on the business or affairs of the 
Exchange. 

8.10 The Board may allow special remuneration by a fixed 
sum or salary to any Director rendering any special servirns 
or undertaking work additional to that normally required of 
the Directors. This provision shall also empower the Board 
to authorise additional payment to the Chairman where his 
commitment to the affairs of the Exchange substantially 
exceeds that reasonably expected of a nonexecutive 
chairman. 

8.11 Any Director or any firm of which that Director is a 
member or partner may act in a professional capacity for the 
Exchange and shall be entitled to remuneration for 
professional services as if the Director were not a Director. 
A Director or that Director's firm shall not act as auditor to 
the Exchange. 

8.12 At each annual meeting 2 member Directors and 1 
nonmember Director shall retire from office. The Directors 
to retire shall be those who have been longest in office since 
their last election. 

8.13 As between persons who became Directors on the same 
day those to retire by rotation shall (unless they otherwise 
agree) be determined by lot. 

8.14 A Director who is retiring in terms of Rule 8.12 may offer 
himself for re-election and shall be deemed to have been re­
elected unless at the meeting it is resolved that the vacated 
office shall not be filled or that the retiring Director shall not 
be re-elected. 

8.15 A retiring Director who is not standing for re-election 
shall hold office until the closure or adjournment of the 
meeting at which any successor of the retiring Director is 
elected. 

8.16 The appointment of any Director shall be terminated: 

8.161 At any time agreed upon by a majority of the Board; 

8.162 Upon the death or resignation in writing of that 
Director; 


