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Extra Regimental Employment 

Headquarters Land Force Command 

The following are transferred to the Army Reserve, General 
List of Officers, in their present rank with effect from 1 April 
1990: 

Brigadier Richard Ewart Menzies, c.B.E.. E.D.**, DIP.AGR., 
Brigadiers' List (TF). 

Colonel Richard Greville Clouston, E.o.•, Colonels' List (TF). 

Colonel D. McGregor, O.B.E., E.o.•, to be Brigadier with 
seniority and effect from 1 April 1990, and is transferred to the 
Brigadiers' List (TF) on assuming the appointment of 
Territorial Force Advisor to the Army General Staff, vice 
Brigadier R. E. Menzies, C.B.E .. E.o.**. 

Lieutenant Colonel J. P. O'Brien, E.o.**, M.SC., to be Colonel 
with seniority and effect from 1 April 1990 and is transferred 
to the Colonels' List (TF). 

Temporary Lieutenant Colonel David Ronald Wilton, 
B.SC.(MIL), RNZ Sigs, is transferred from the Army Reserve, 
General List of Officers, in the rank of Lieutenant Colonel with 
seniority and effect from 26 March 1990. 

Major John Alistair Goodman, DIP.AGR., RNZEME, is posted 
to the Retired List with effect from 1 October 1989. 

Major James Utanga Morgan, B.soc.sc., RNZAEC, is 
transferred from the Army Reserve, General List of Officers, in 
his present rank with seniority from 6 December 1987 and 
effect from 9 March 1990. 

Headquarters 3rd Task Force 

Major William David Wallace, E.o.•, B.SC., RNZAMC, is posted 
to the Retired List with effect from 21 March 1990. 

ARMY RESERVE 

Regimental List of Officers 

The following are posted to the Retired List with effect from 
the date shown: 

16th Field Regiment, RNZA 

Major Christopher John Hardley, M.B.E., E.D., B.E.(HONS), 23 
November 1989. 

7th Battalion (Wellington (City of Wellington's Own) and 
Hawkes Bay}, RNZIR 

Temporary Captain Jonathan George Linsey Davies, 1 
November 1989 (in the rank of Captain). 

General List of Officers 

The following are transferred to the Territorial Force with 
effect from the date shown: 

Royal Regiment of NZ Artillery 

Captain C. R. Andrews, 26 January 1990. 

Royal NZ Corps of Signals 

Temporary Lieutenant Colonel D. R. Wilton, B.SC.(MIL), 26 
March 1990. 

Royal NZ Army Education Corps 

Major J. U. Morgan, B.soc.sc., 9 March 1990. 

The following are posted to the Retired List with effect from 
the date shown: 

Royal Regiment of NZ Artillery 

Temporary Lieutenant Colonel Richard Hugh Williams, 24 
March 1990 (in the rank of Lieutenant Colonel). 

Royal NZ Infantry Regiment 

Lieutenant Colonel Barry Stanley Dyer, 24 May 1990. 

Temporary Captain John William Hatton, 2 May 1990 (in the 
rank of Captain). 

Royal NZ Corps of Transport 

Lieutenant Colonel James Moir Young, DIP.ARTS(MIL), 17 
March 1990. 

Temporary Captain Barbara Mary Wilson, 3 April 1990 (in the 
rank of Captain). 

Royal NZ. Army Ordnance Corps 

Temporary Captain and Quartermaster David Kent Hayden, 9 
March 1990 (in the rank of Captain and Quartermaster). 

The Corps of Royal NZ. Electrical and Mechanical 
Engineers 

Temporary Captain and Quartermaster Terrence Martin 
Swaney, 29 March 1990 (in the rank of Captain and 
Quartermaster). 

Temporary Captain and Quartermaster Desmond Russell 
Hammond, 30 April 1990 (in the rank of Captain and 
Quartermaster). 

Royal NZ Nursing Corps 

Captain Maureen Maree Frankpitt, 19 May 1990. 

RETIRED LIST 

Lieutenant Colonel A. C. Smillie, E.D., B.D.S., M.D.S., PH.D., 
RNZDC, is granted the honorary rank of Colonel, and is 
appointed Honorary Consultant in Oral Pathology to the New 
Zealand Armed Forces. 

Dated at Wellington this 8th day of August 1990. 

PETER TAPSELL, Minister of Defence. 
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Education 
Education Act 1964 

Cancellation of Registration as a Teacher 

21 

Pursuant to section 135 (1) of the Education Act 1964, the 
name of Malcolm Murray Jones has been removed from the 
Teachers Register and his teacher's certificate and registration 
have been cancelled. 

J. G. SIMPSON, General Manager, Education Residual 
Management Unit. 
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Internal Affairs 
Bylaws Act 1910 

Auckland Regional Authority Bylaws Confirmed 
The following certificate has been executed on a sealed copy of 
the Auckland Regional Authority Refuse Disposal Amendment 
Bylaw 1988 No. 2 made by special order of the Auckland 
Regional Authority on 18 July 1988 and confirmed at a 
subsequent Authority meeting on 15 August 1988. 

Signed at Wellington this 6th day of August 1990. 

PHILIP WOOLLASTON, Minister of Local Government. 

Certificate of Confirmation 

Pursuant to the Bylaws Act 1910, I hereby confirm the above 
bylaws and declare that the same come into force on 1 
September 1988. 

Signed at Wellington this 6th day of August 1990. 

PHILIP WOOLLASTON, Minister of Local Government. 
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